
 
 

License Agreement 

Stewart Title Guaranty Company, 1980 Post Oak Blvd. Suite 800, Houston, TX 77056 (“Licensor”) has developed 
and hereby licenses to the undersigned policy issuing agency (“Licensee”) of Stewart Title Insurance Company or 
Licensor (jointly referred to as “Stewart”) certain policy templates (“the Templates”) that consist of integrated 
policies, procedures, guidelines and best practices that provide basic documentation as to regulatory compliance 
practices across a broad range of operational areas. In using the Templates, Licensee acknowledges that it is solely 
responsible for determining what policies, procedures and processes are necessary in order for Licensee to meet 
the requirements of its customers and state and federal regulators. 
 
The Templates contain proprietary information and are provided to Licensee subject to restrictions on use and 
distribution as hereinafter set forth. None of the Templates may be reproduced or transmitted electronically, in full 
or in part, for use by any party other than Licensee.  The Templates are protected by copyright, trademark, and 
other intellectual property laws. The information contained in the Templates is subject to change without notice 
and is not warranted to be error-free.  
 
The Templates are provided for informational purposes only. The Templates are not offered as, nor should they be 
construed as legal advice, accounting, or other professional advice. As such, none of the Templates should be 
used by Licensee as a substitute for consultation with legal and other competent advisers. Licensee’s receipt or 
use of the Templates is not to be construed as legal advice or to constitute an attorney-client relationship.  
Licensee should not act or rely upon or use the Templates without specifically seeking competent professional 
advice.  The Templates may contain links to web sites and access to content, products, and services from third 
parties. Stewart is not responsible for the availability or accuracy of any content provided on third-party web sites 
or referenced materials. If you find any problems in the documentation, please report them to Stewart via e-mail 
to agencyservices@stewart.com. 
 
This license is perpetual and shall be effective upon Licensor’s receipt of this fully executed agreement and 
validation of Licensee’s status as a Stewart policy issuing agency in good standing and shall continue in effect so 
long as Licensee shall remain a policy issuing agency of Stewart.  Subject to the forgoing, this license shall remain 
in effect and shall include any future updates of the Templates that may be developed by Stewart; however, 
Stewart makes no guarantee as to the provision of any future updates. This License shall terminate automatically if 
Licensee fails to comply with any of the terms and conditions described herein. 
 

Licensee (Agency):   
Stewart Agency ID:   

Primary Street Address:   
City, State, Zip:    

Phone:    
Primary Contact Person:   Email:  

Secondary Contact Person:   Email:  
 
                        Licensee: 

 

 x  
       (signature)  

Printed Name: 
Title:  
Date:  

 


	Licensee Agency: 
	Stewart Agency ID: 
	Primary Street Address: 
	City State Zip: 
	Phone: 
	Primary Contact Person: 
	Email: 
	Secondary Contact Person: 
	Email_2: 
	Printed Name: 
	Title: 
	Date: 


